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BID OPENING RESULTS

BID NO: 08/2/22/44

DESCRIPTION OF BID: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES FOR WITZENBERG MUNICIPALITY

[CLOSING TIME AND DATE OF BID: 10:00 - 16 MAY 2025

1 2 3 4 5
Bidder Name: Civil De:ﬁ]}r’\) Ii?:ilibrium Md:z?\ ;:i:::t:slﬁng ROMH Consulting Sirocco(l;q?)tf;gaﬁonal Lukhg;igﬁc;r;:liing
Cluster 1 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 2 No bid No bid R 8351 990.00 R 5456 750.00 R 6 509 00.00
Cluster 3 No bid R 5877 535.00 No bid No bid R 6 049 000.00
Cluster 4 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 5 R 5277 695.00 No bid R 7 006 490.00 R 5 600 500.00 R 5819 000.00
Cluster 6 No bid No bid R 6 477 490.00 R 5586 700.00 R 6 169 750.00
Cluster 7 No bid No bid No bid No bid R 1565 725.00
Cluster 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid R 775 445.00
Cluster 9 No bid No bid R 2 642 240.00 R 3 387 200.00 R 2788 750.00
BBBEEVS;?NS Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 2
OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE FOR OPENING OF BID
S MENTOR M LUKAS H SNYERS J PIETERSE M FRIESLAAR L GREEN W JONKERS A POOLE

Please note that the accuracy of all information contained herein is not final and is subject o an evaluation process in accordance with the applicable prescripts.

1




NN L — = NN = X C

Municipality =

BT R,

Munisippalitei

LM asipala Wwase

6 7 8 9 10
Bidder Name: Re-solve Consulting Bigen Africa Services Invictus Engineering SMEC South Africa (Pty) 2 MC Consulting
(Pty) Lid (Pty) Lid Services Lid Engineers (Pty) Lid
Cluster 1 R 4 554 000.00 No bid No bid R 5295 750.00 No bid
Cluster 2 R 5482 625.00 R 6251 975.00 R 5476 785.00 R 9 357 550.00 R 6 506 994.40
Cluster 3 No bid R 7 422 90500 No bid R 6 663 330.00 No bid
Cluster 4 No bid No bid No bid R 7 008 100.00 No bid
Cluster 5 No bid No bid R 4 648 875.00 R 7 922 350.00 R 6 506 994.40
Cluster 6 No bid R 6 882 405.00 No bid R 9 432 415.00 R 6 748 494.40
Cluster 7 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 9 No bid R 3771 655.00 No bid No bid No bid
BBBE;,S(;?*US Level 2 Level 1 Level 3 Level 1 Level 1
OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE FOR OPENING OF BID
S MENTOR M LUKAS H SNYERS J PIETERSE M FRIESLAAR L GREEN W JONKERS A POOLE

Please note that the accuracy of all information contained herein is not final and is subject to an evaluation process in accordance with the applicable prescripts.
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11 12 13 14 15
Bidder Name: V3 Consulting Engineers | Byron Star Investments Ingerop South Africa CVW Consulting Mitchell du Plessis
(Pty) Lid (Pty) Lid (Pty) Lid Engineers (Pty) Lid Projects (Pty) Ltd
Cluster 1 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 2 R 4257 162.00 No bid R 4861 050.00 R 4 935 800.00 No bid
Cluster 3 No bid No bid R 4 585 050.00 No bid No bid
Cluster 4 No bid No bid R 4 585 050.00 No bid No bid
Cluster 5 R 4257 162.00 R 4 326 300.00 R 4 585 050.00 No bid No bid
Cluster 6 R4814912.00 No bid R 4 585 050.00 No bid No bid
Cluster 7 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 9 R 2 645 400.00 No bid No bid No bid R 3 004 209.67
BBBEZVS(:?NS Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 4
OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE FOR OPENING OF BID
S MENTOR M LUKAS H SNYERS J PIETERSE M FRIESLAAR L GREEN W JONKERS A POOLE

Please note that the accuracy of all infformation contained herein is not final and is subject o an evaluation process in accordance with the applicable prescripts.
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16 17 18 19 20
paderNome: | ouapl Corsng P) | wec comsu (tylia | HCE(P)Ua | Meltinemond | Sy Hion Consatng
Cluster 1 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 2 R 6 092 470 R 5240 550.00 No bid R 4 608 510.00 R 6 533 150.00
Cluster 3 R 5595 670 No bid No bid R 4 053 750.00 No bid
Cluster 4 No bid No bid R 4 966 482.00 No bid No bid
Cluster 5 R 5595 670 R 4 709 250.00 No bid R 4 386 606.00 R 6 187 460.00
Cluster 6 R 5595 670 R 4 709 250.00 No bid R 4 386 606.00 No bid
Cluster 7 No bid No bid No bid R 1749 725.00 No bid
Cluster 8 No bid No bid No bid R 775 445.00 No bid
Cluster 9 R2753 100 No bid No bid No bid No bid
BBBEE Status Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 2
Level
OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE FOR OPENING OF BID
S MENTOR M LUKAS H SNYERS J PIETERSE MFRIESLAAR ~ LGREEN W JONKERS A POOLE

Please note that the accuracy of all information contained herein is not final and is subject to an evaluation process in accordance with the applicable prescripts.
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21 22 23 24

BT ':g;;’;gei‘z::;’)"{?g Bosch Projects (Pty) Ltd Zutari (Ply) Ltd iX Engineers (Pty) Ltd
Cluster 1 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 2 No bid R 6 033 360.00 R 5564 059.81 R 7 004 995.00
Cluster 3 No bid R 5293 680.00 R 4925715.09 R 6 081 545.00
Cluster 4 No bid No bid R 4729 573.32 No bid
Cluster 5 R 5400 975.00 R 5293 680.00 R 4903 518.67 R 4 829 770.00
Cluster 6 No bid No bid R 4881 910.08 No bid
Cluster 7 No bid No bid R 1631706.25 No bid
Cluster 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Cluster 9 No bid No bid R 2 358 650.00 R 2712 045.00

BBBE:\,S;“US Level 1 Level 1 Level 1 Level 1

OFFICIALS RESPONSIBLE FOR OPENING OF BID
S MENTOR M LUKAS H SNYERS J PIETERSE M FRIESLAAR L GREEN W JONKERS A POOLE

Please note that the accuracy of all information contained herein is not final and is subject to an evaluation process in accordance with the applicable prescripts.




